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OBTAINING SPECIALIZED RESEARCH AND TECHNICAL ASSISTANCE FROM 
THE DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Please reference the Office of the Under Secretary of Defense Memorandum, dated December 
16,2010, subject: Standard Interagency Agreement Part A for DOD Components and All DOE 
Activities in FY 20 1 1. 

The referenced Memorandum (copy attached) implements a standard process between the 
Department of Defense (DOD) and the Department of Energy (DOE) for reimbursable 
interagency acquisitions (IA) using the DOE Work For Others (WFO) program. The IA process 
is administered in accordance with the signed Memorandum of Agreement (MOA) Between 
DOD and DOE Governing Department of Defense Funded Work Performed at the Department 
of Energy Laboratories and Facilities, dated 16 September 201 0. 

DOE sponsors a specialized research and technical assistance program under its WFO program. 
This program furnishes reimbursable support to DOD as part of the services rendered to-and-for 
US government activities under various laws and regulations, principally, the Economy Act and 
the Atomic Energy Act of 1954. All reimbursable DOD work proposed for the WFO program 
comes under a stringent DOE review and approval process. Approval by a DOE Contracting 
Officer of a DOD reimbursable IA indicates certification that the DOD reimbursable work is 
consistent with the DOE legislative authority, complies with DOE policies as required in DOE 
Orders, is within scope of the DOE performance-based contract through which the work is 
conducted, and is compliant with the joint DOD and DOE MOA. 

UT-Battelle, LLC, manages and operates the governrnent-owned Oak Ridge National Laboratory 
(ORNL) on behalf of DOE in accordance with the Federal Acquisition Regulation (FAR) 
Subpart 17.6. ORNL is a Federal Laboratory as defined in 15 USC 3710 a (d) (2) and is also a 
federally h d e d  research and development center (FFRDC) as specified in FAR 35.017. DOE'S 
management and operating (M&O) contractors are financially integrated with DOE and operate 
under strict DOE controls and guidelines. DOE M&O contractors are separate corporate entities 
from their parent company(s) set up solely to perform work assigned by DOE, including DOD 
reimbursable IA work which DOE accepts under the joint MOA . 
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The DOE Oak Ridge Office (ORO) believes that the joint DOD and DOE procedures identified 
in the Memorandum referenced above are implemented at OR0 and ORNL and that appropriate 
procedures are in place for DOD reimbursable IAs. In order to facilitate the DOD approval 
process, DOE OR0 previously authorized ORNL research staff to assist DOD personnel in 
preparing the necessary justifications on ORNL unique capabilities and special expertise. 

If assistance is required in the acquiring of services from ORNL, please contact me at (865) 576- 
7343, or Mr. Robert Hamilton at (865) 576-7723. 

Sincerely, 

~ a r ~ y o u  Crow 
Contracting Officer 
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